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From the experts at Jarden Home Brands, makers of Ball canning products, comes the first truly
comprehensive canning guide created for today's home cooks. This modern handbook boasts more than 200
brand new recipes ranging from jams and jellies to jerkies, pickles, salsas, and more.

Organized by technique, The All New Ball Book of Canning and Preserving covers water bath and pressure
canning, pickling, fermenting, freezing, dehydrating, and smoking. Straightforward instructions and
step–by–step photos ensure success for beginners, while practiced home canners will find more advanced
methods and inspiring ingredient twists.

Tested for quality and safety, recipes range from much–loved classics—Tart Lemon Jelly, Tomato–Herb
Jam, Ploughman's Pickles—to fresh flavors such as Asian Pear Kimchi, Smoked Maple–Juniper Bacon, and
homemade Kombucha. Make the most of your preserves with delicious dishes including Crab Cakes
garnished with Eastern Shore Corn Relish and traditional Strawberry–Rhubarb Hand Pies. Special sidebars
highlight seasonal fruits and vegetables, while handy charts cover processing times, temperatures, and recipe
formulas for fast preparation.

Lushly illustrated with color photographs, The All New Ball Book of Canning and Preserving is a classic in
the making for a new generation of home cooks.
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From reader reviews:

Sarah Fernandez:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book The All New Ball Book Of
Canning And Preserving: Over 200 of the Best Canned, Jammed, Pickled, and Preserved Recipes. All type of
book can you see on many options. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Michael Stricklin:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How people have to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a book can
help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The All New Ball Book Of Canning And
Preserving: Over 200 of the Best Canned, Jammed, Pickled, and Preserved Recipes book because this book
offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no
doubt in it everbody knows.

Joe Timmons:

The e-book untitled The All New Ball Book Of Canning And Preserving: Over 200 of the Best Canned,
Jammed, Pickled, and Preserved Recipes is the e-book that recommended to you to learn. You can see the
quality of the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The language that article author use to explained
their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, so the
information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of The All New Ball
Book Of Canning And Preserving: Over 200 of the Best Canned, Jammed, Pickled, and Preserved Recipes
from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Kelly Mays:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, quick story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping The All New Ball Book Of
Canning And Preserving: Over 200 of the Best Canned, Jammed, Pickled, and Preserved Recipes that give
your enjoyment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the
world can be said as the means for people to know world better then how they react in the direction of the
world. It can't be explained constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you
who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit, you
are able to pick The All New Ball Book Of Canning And Preserving: Over 200 of the Best Canned, Jammed,
Pickled, and Preserved Recipes become your current starter.
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