
Customary International Law in Times of
Fundamental Change

Michael P. Scharf

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B00D5RJEIY
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B00D5RJEIY
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B00D5RJEIY


Customary International Law in Times of Fundamental
Change

Michael P. Scharf

Customary International Law in Times of Fundamental Change Michael P. Scharf
This is the first book to explore the concept of 'Grotian Moments'. Named for Hugo Grotius, whose
masterpiece De jure belli ac pacis helped marshal in the modern system of international law, Grotian
Moments are transformative developments that generate the unique conditions for accelerated formation of
customary international law. In periods of fundamental change, whether by technological advances, the
commission of new forms of crimes against humanity, or the development of new means of warfare or
terrorism, customary international law may form much more rapidly and with less state practice than is
normally the case to keep up with the pace of developments. The book examines the historic underpinnings
of the Grotian Moment concept, provides a theoretical framework for testing its existence and application,
and analyzes six case studies of potential Grotian Moments: Nuremberg, the continental shelf, space law, the
Yugoslavia Tribunal's Tadic decision, the 1999 NATO intervention in Serbia and the 9/11 terrorist attacks.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Sparkman:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible Customary
International Law in Times of Fundamental Change? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You recognize
beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree
with the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Daniel Butler:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their own reader with
their story as well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the books. But also they write about
the information about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their expertise in writing, they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of them is this
Customary International Law in Times of Fundamental Change.

Kathryn Sheffield:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find reserve that need more time
to be go through. Customary International Law in Times of Fundamental Change can be your answer since it
can be read by anyone who have those short spare time problems.

Julie Long:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book Customary International Law in
Times of Fundamental Change to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of
reading proficiency is developing when you like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you
just read it and mingle the feeling about book and looking at especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to
like to start a book and study it. Beside that the guide Customary International Law in Times of Fundamental
Change can to be your new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of
these time.
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