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With his stunning debut novel, Vellum, Hal Duncan shattered the boundaries between genres. Fantasy, or
science fiction, Vellum shocked with the boldness of its ideas, seduced with the sensual beauty of its prose,
and astonished with its imaginative sweep. Now Duncan returns with another epic tour de force that
surpasses all expectations.

INK: The Book of All Hours

Once, in the depths of prehistory, they were human. But in a moment of brutal transfiguration, they became
unkin, beings who possessed the power to alter reality by accessing the Vellum: a realm of eternity
containing every possibility, every paradox, every heaven . . . and every hell. The Vellum became a
battleground where forces of order and chaos fought across time and space. The ultimate weapon in that
bloody war spanning through history and myth, dreams and memory, was The Book of All Hours, a
legendary tome within which the blueprint for all reality is inscribed, a volume long lost amid the infinite
folds of the Vellum.

Until, in 2017, it was found by Reynard Carter, a young man with the blood of unkin in his veins.

Until Phreedom Messenger and her brother, Thomas, were swept up in an archetypal dance of death and
rebirth.

Until a hermit named Seamus Finnan found the courage to re-forge his broken soul, and a self-proclaimed
angel called Metatron unleashed a plague of AI bitmites.

Now, in the aftermath of the apocalypse, several survivors search desperately for the remnants of themselves
scattered across the Vellum like torn pages, determined to use the blood of the unkin to rewrite The Book of
All Hours, and to forge a new destiny for themselves and all humanity. Reality will never be the same.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Harlow:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy
individual? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They must answer that question
due to the fact just their can do that. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
suitable. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this Ink: The Book of All Hours to read.

Carol Boissonneault:

Here thing why this Ink: The Book of All Hours are different and dependable to be yours. First of all
studying a book is good but it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as delicious as food
or not. Ink: The Book of All Hours giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any
publication out there but there is no book that similar with Ink: The Book of All Hours. It gives you thrill
looking at journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is
might be can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even
in your technique home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the
form of Ink: The Book of All Hours in e-book can be your option.

Kevin Porter:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that
need more time to be examine. Ink: The Book of All Hours can be your answer mainly because it can be read
by you who have those short extra time problems.

Roderick Grubb:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you read
a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as well as
soon. The Ink: The Book of All Hours will give you new experience in examining a book.
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