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The European Union is China’s largest trading partner, and Chinese views of the EU are of crucial
importance in shaping how the relationship will develop in the future, especially as the new Chinese
leadership takes power. This book presents the findings of an extensive research project into the views of
both elite groups, in government, business, academia, media and social activists, and the Chinese public
towards Europe and the European Union. It considers attitudes on a wide range of subjects, and reaches a
number of interesting, encouraging conclusions. These include the fact that as Chinese people’s knowledge
of, and travel to, Europe becomes more extensive, Chinese attitudes towards Europe become more positive;
that Chinese people have a high regard for European culture and a high degree of trust in Europeans; though
there are significant differences between different Chinese groups concerning controversial issues in the
China-EU relationship. Overall, the book concludes that the Chinese public opinion supports a strong
bilateral relation.
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Ramsey:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a move, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book allowed China
and the European Union (China Policy Series)? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You recognize beside
you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion
or you have various other opinion?

Jane Nelsen:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a book. Book has
a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Adjacent to that you
can your reading talent was fluently. A publication China and the European Union (China Policy Series) will
make you to end up being smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about almost
everything. But some of you think this open or reading any book make you bored. It is not necessarily make
you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable book with
you?

Theodore Dubose:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what you problem? How about your time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have
spare time to try and do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? Everyone has many questions above. They need to answer that question because just their can do
that will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from on
pre-school until university need this specific China and the European Union (China Policy Series) to read.

Edward Doucet:

The book China and the European Union (China Policy Series) will bring that you the new experience of
reading some sort of book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new
book to learn, this book very suited to you. The book China and the European Union (China Policy Series) is
much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can
more easily to read the book.
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