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From Book 1:

Voodoo is a shadowy business. So is murder.

Shadow, Book 1

Mia LeMay’s Creole ancestry spices the atmosphere that permeates her bluesy New Orleans nightclub and
sugar-dusted tearoom. But her cloistered world shatters when she witnesses a murder—and she’s forced to
put her life in the hands of a man she’s never met.

A man whose golden eyes hide as many dark secrets as the killer who wants her dead.

Even as Agent Rick Ryder whisks Mia into the teeth of a tropical storm, guilt twists like a knife in his gut.
He has a personal stake in keeping the black-haired beauty safe. Once his superiors figure out what he pulled
to make sure he’s the one watching her back, his life will be worth about as much as hers if he fails.

Deep in the Louisiana mangroves, desire envelopes them like the steamy bayou mist. But there are many
things lurking in the shadows. Things that slither. Things that bite. And something evil that’s determined to
make sure Mia never sees the light of another dawn…

This title has been previously published.

Warning: Contains a sexy federal agent (or is he?) who’s a ticking time bomb, and a woman with the bayou
in her blood and a wicked way with stiletto heels. Grab your gris gris bag, gaienne, the real bad is comin’!
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From reader reviews:

Jesse Valles:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication Shadows (4 Book Series)
will make you to become smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about every
little thing. But some of you think that will open or reading a new book make you bored. It is far from make
you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or appropriate book with you?

Roberto Reyes:

Reading a book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their particular reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the ebooks. But also they write about
the ability about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to their book. One of them is this
Shadows (4 Book Series).

Sara Pacheco:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its cover may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in
the outside search likes. Maybe you answer might be Shadows (4 Book Series) why because the excellent
cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is
fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up
this book.

Colin Rousey:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart or
real their hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on
this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this Shadows (4 Book Series) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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