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Gore Vidal has hailed John Rechy as “one of the few original American writers of the last century,” and
Michael Cunningham has called him an author “whose life is almost as interesting, and meaningful, as his
work.” Rechy’s long-awaited memoir,About My Life and the Kept Woman, is the author’s first open
treatment of his life—and a testament to the power of pride and self-acceptance. Raised Mexican-American
in El Paso, Texas, at a time when Latino children were routinely segregated, Rechy was often assumed to be
Anglo because of his light skin, and had his name “changed” for him by a teacher, from Juan to John. As he
grew older—and as his fascination with the memory of a notorious kept woman in his childhood
deepened—Rechy became aware that his differences lay not just in his heritage, but in his sexuality. A
moving, powerful story of a life that bears witness to some of the most riotous changes of the past
century,About My Life and the Kept Woman is as much a portrait of intolerance as of an individual who
defied it to forge his own path.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Moyer:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim as well as goal; it means
that book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Consider the person
who don't like studying a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult
problem as well as exercise. Well, probably you will need this About My Life and the Kept Woman: A
Memoir.

Patrice Reese:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people
in the world, what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or something
that they don't need do that. You must know how great as well as important the book About My Life and the
Kept Woman: A Memoir. All type of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet
options or other social media.

Gary Games:

The reserve with title About My Life and the Kept Woman: A Memoir posesses a lot of information that you
can find out it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to
yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you
want.

Jonathan Rodriguez:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love About My Life and the Kept Woman: A
Memoir, you are able to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its named
reading friends.
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