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When the Soviet Union invades its tiny neighbor Finland in November 1939, Marko volunteers to help the
war effort. Even though his leg was weakened by polio, he can ski well, and he becomes a messenger on the
front line, skiing in white camouflage through the forests at night. The dark forest is terrifying, and so are the
odds against the Finns: the Russians have 4 times as many soldiers and 30 times as many planes. They have
3000 tanks, while the Finns have 30. But a tank is no help in the snowy forest–a boy on skis is. And the
Russians don’t know winter the way the Finns do, or what tough guerrilla warriors the Finns are. Marko
teams up with another messenger, Karl. Gradually Marko learns that Karl’s whole family was killed by the
Russians. And Karl has a secret–he’s really Kaari, a girl who joined up to get revenge for her family’s
deaths.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Anderson:

The ability that you get from The Winter War: A Novel is a more deep you rooting the information that hide
into the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to understand
but The Winter War: A Novel giving you thrill feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in certain
way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the idea because the author of this e-book is well-
known enough. This specific book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. That makes it
easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend
you for having this particular The Winter War: A Novel instantly.

Charles Edwards:

The reason why? Because this The Winter War: A Novel is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret this inside. Reading this book close to it
was fantastic author who else write the book in such remarkable way makes the content inside easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of gains than the
other book get such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to
delay having that book? If I have been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Bernard Kovach:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer can be The Winter War: A Novel why because the great cover that
make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is actually
fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up
this book.

Jessica Adkins:

The book untitled The Winter War: A Novel contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains the
woman idea with easy means. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do certainly not worry,
you can easy to read this. The book was authored by famous author. The author will bring you in the new
period of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or
program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can
wide open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.
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