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In questo prezioso Volume, vengono presentate le interessantissime scoperte del neurologo italiano Giuseppe
Calligaris circa lo sviluppo e la naturale stimolazione della Telepatia, la Chiaroveggenza e la Telediagnosi,
solo stimolando specifiche zone della pelle, chiamata dallo Scienziato visionario “placche cutanee”, e
seguendo una fitta rete di linee energetiche del corpo da lui scoperte e “mappate”, definite da lui stesso “le
catene lineari del corpo e dello spirito”. Il Calligaris otteneva artificialmente tutti questi fenomeni
parapsicologici che generalmente si conseguono con lunghi esercizi di tipo yoga.

Stimolando termicamente ed elettricamente determinate zone della pelle, riusciva a far trasmettere il pensiero
e ricavare, a notevoli distanze, diagnosi di malattie e cure appropriate, con l’emissione di onde biomentali.
Chiunque poteva diventare chiaroveggente, telepatico, rabdomante e guaritore per un certo tempo. Cessati gli
stimoli delle placche cutanee, la persona che si sottoponeva all’esperimento poco alla volta perdeva i poteri
psichici. Un libro di enorme interesse ed utilità per i seri studiosi dell’argomento.
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Powell:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind
of guide you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience
happy read one along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The Telepatia e Telediagnosi
(Italian Edition) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Timothy Montgomery:

You are able to spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Telepatia e Telediagnosi
(Italian Edition) is simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did
not have got much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you
much easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when one buys this book.

Jonathan Carney:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of the books in the top
listing in your reading list is actually Telepatia e Telediagnosi (Italian Edition). This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards
and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Shirley Pedro:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information coming from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source in which filled
update of news. In this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you
actually. From media social such as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference
book, fresh and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to
open your book? Or just searching for the Telepatia e Telediagnosi (Italian Edition) when you needed it?
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