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From a distinguished psychologist, mother, and Latina, Parenting with Pride Latino Style offers the first
bicultural child-rearing approach for Latino parents. This groundbreaking book supports families in raising
their children with time-honored Hispanic values while incorporating the best that North America has to
offer.

Dr. Vazquez's unique parenting method, the New Traditionalism (El Nuevo Tradicionalismo), preserves
classic Latino ideals, such as pride, family loyalty, and courtesy, while helping parents revise their traditional
authoritarian child-rearing style, blending the best of Latino and American cultures and dramatically
reducing cultural conflict in the family. Her seven steps to successful parenting are grounded in the acronym
ORGULLO ("pride"):

O: Organize your feelings R: Respect your child's feelings G: Guide and teach your child; do not dictate U:
Update your media awareness often L: Love your child for who she or he is L: Listen to your child O: Open
the communication channels -- and keep them open

Self-assessments and reflection exercises help parents resolve the dilemmas produced when two cultures
combine. Detailed examples show how to use these methods immediately in daily life -- from family
relationships to children's friendships to school issues.

Clear, compassionate, and based on Dr. Vazquez's personal experience as a Latina professional and parent,
Parenting with Pride Latino Style is the one book that enables contemporary Latino parents to pass on their
rich cultural heritage to their children -- and to future generations as well.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Davis:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great and important the book Parenting with Pride Latino Style. All
type of book are you able to see on many options. You can look for the internet options or other social
media.

Antonio Beeler:

This Parenting with Pride Latino Style tend to be reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why.
The reason of this Parenting with Pride Latino Style can be one of several great books you must have is
definitely giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you actually with information that maybe
will shock your prior knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it all over the place and
whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed types. Beside that this Parenting with Pride Latino Style
forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical
thinking that we understand it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Kenton Marshall:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping Parenting with Pride Latino Style
that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading behavior all over
the world can be said as the method for people to know world far better then how they react towards the
world. It can't be explained constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants
to possibly be success person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, you are
able to pick Parenting with Pride Latino Style become your personal starter.

Sandra Kelley:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Parenting with Pride Latino Style can be
the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time
by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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