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Now in a second edition, the award-winning The Trouble with Maths offers important insights into the often
confusing world of numeracy. By looking at learning difficulties in maths from several perspectives,
including the language of mathematics, thinking styles and the demands of individual topics, this book offers
a complete overview of the most common problems associated with mathematics teaching and learning. It
draws on tried-and-tested methods based on research and the author’s many years of classroom experience to
provide an authoritative yet highly accessible one-stop classroom resource.

Combining advice, guidance and practical activities, this user-friendly guide will enable you to:

develop flexible thinking skills;●

use alternative strategies for pupils to access basic facts;●

understand the implications of pre-requisite skills, such as working memory, on learning;●

implement effective preventative measures before disaffection sets in;●

recognise maths anxiety and tackle self-esteem problems;●

tackle the difficulties with word problems that many pupils may have;●

select appropriate materials to enhance understanding.●



With useful features such as checklists for the evaluation of books, an outline for setting up an inclusive
Maths Department policy and a brand new chapter on materials, manipulatives and communication, this
book will equip you with the essential skills to tackle your pupils’ maths difficulties and improve standards.
This book will be useful for all teachers, classroom assistants, learning support assistants and parents who
have pupils who underachieve with maths.
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From reader reviews:

Pearl McLean:

Throughout other case, little folks like to read book The Trouble with Maths: A Practical Guide to Helping
Learners with Numeracy Difficulties. You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. So long as
we know about how is important a book The Trouble with Maths: A Practical Guide to Helping Learners
with Numeracy Difficulties. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can know everything! From your country right up until
foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you may know that. In this
era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You should use it
when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's go through.

Sonia Shipley:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book and so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a reserve you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to share
the information as well as their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the characters
do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this The Trouble
with Maths: A Practical Guide to Helping Learners with Numeracy Difficulties, you may tells your family,
friends and soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a
guide.

Luciana Findley:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you will get
it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This specific The Trouble with Maths: A Practical Guide to
Helping Learners with Numeracy Difficulties can give you a lot of close friends because by you considering
this one book you have matter that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This particular
book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that possibly your
friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than different make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let me
have The Trouble with Maths: A Practical Guide to Helping Learners with Numeracy Difficulties.

Gloria Taylor:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is created or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. On this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social including
newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking



the The Trouble with Maths: A Practical Guide to Helping Learners with Numeracy Difficulties when you
needed it?
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