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Do audit cultures deliver greater responsibility, or do they stifle creative thought?
We are all increasingly subjected to auditing, and alongside that, subject to accountability for our behaviour
and actions. Audit cultures pervade in the workplace, our governmental and public institutions as well as
academia. However, audit practices themselves have consequences, beneficial and detrimental, that often go
unexamined.
This book examines how pervasive practices of accountability are, the political and cultural conditions under
which accountability flourishes and the consequences of their application. Twelve social anthropologists
look at this influential and controversial phenomenon, and map out the effects around Europe and the
Commonwealth, as well as in contexts such as the European Commission, the International Monetary Fund
and Academic institutions. The result provides an excellent insight into auditing and its dependence on
precepts of economic efficiency and ethical practice. This point of convergence between these moral and
financial priorities provides an excellent opening for debate on the culture of management and
accountability.
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From reader reviews:

Carla Smith:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be update about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to
an individual is you don't know which one you should start with. This Audit Cultures: Anthropological
Studies in Accountability, Ethics and the Academy (European Association of Social Anthropologists) is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and want in this
era.

Francisco Gentry:

Audit Cultures: Anthropological Studies in Accountability, Ethics and the Academy (European Association
of Social Anthropologists) can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We recommend that straight
away because this publication has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to
place every word into joy arrangement in writing Audit Cultures: Anthropological Studies in Accountability,
Ethics and the Academy (European Association of Social Anthropologists) although doesn't forget the main
level, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource information that maybe you can be
among it. This great information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial thinking.

Denise Welton:

The book untitled Audit Cultures: Anthropological Studies in Accountability, Ethics and the Academy
(European Association of Social Anthropologists) contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer
explains your ex idea with easy method. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not
worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was published by famous author. The author brings you in the
new age of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue reading your smart
phone, or model, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice study.

Robert Nichols:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do is just spending
your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of many books in the top
record in your reading list is Audit Cultures: Anthropological Studies in Accountability, Ethics and the
Academy (European Association of Social Anthropologists). This book that is qualified as The Hungry
Hillsides can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking right up and review this e-book
you can get many advantages.
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