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This the story of the seven baseball-playing Boyer brothers from western Missouri who signed professional
contracts in the 1940s, 1950s and 1960s. Led by oldest brother Cloyd, a pitcher, third baseman Ken and third
baseman Clete, three of the seven brothers reached the majors. This book recounts their hardscrabble
upbringing and how they fought their way to success. Initially discouraged by arm injuries that curtailed his
big-league career, Cloyd became a coach and manager at the minor and major league levels, and remained in
the game for nearly half a century. The most accomplished, Ken, became a perennial National League All-
Star, and was the 1964 Most Valuable Player. In the 1960s, he was the face of the St. Louis Cardinals, and
after his playing days ended he returned to manage the team. Clete gained prominence as a regular for the
American League champion New York Yankees, and competed in five World Series before starring in the
National League and concluding his career in Japan. While they did not make it to the top, the other four
brothers enrich the story with their own baseball histories, and help illustrate how the closeness of the family
helped each of them succeed.
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From reader reviews:

Winston Craig:

Here thing why this specific The Boyer Brothers of Baseball are different and dependable to be yours. First
of all reading through a book is good but it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. The Boyer Brothers of Baseball giving you information deeper as different ways,
you can find any publication out there but there is no publication that similar with The Boyer Brothers of
Baseball. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing this
happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere
like in park, café, or even in your technique home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the
imprinted book maybe the form of The Boyer Brothers of Baseball in e-book can be your substitute.

Randy Johnson:

The actual book The Boyer Brothers of Baseball will bring someone to the new experience of reading a
book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to see, this book
very appropriate to you. The book The Boyer Brothers of Baseball is much recommended to you to learn.
You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Joshua Canfield:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
great deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely of course. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the book
you have read is usually The Boyer Brothers of Baseball.

Marilyn Chambers:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a book. They are directly felt that when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book The Boyer Brothers of Baseball to make your
own reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is developing when you just like reading. Try to
choose simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the sensation about book and examining
especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open a book and study it. Beside that the guide The Boyer
Brothers of Baseball can to be a newly purchased friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the
information must you're doing of the time.
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