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Like his mother and grandmother before him, Joseph Jacobs was born into slavery. Joseph lives with his
grandmother and sister in North Carolina, but he has not seen his mother for more than seven years.
Unbeknownst to Joseph, his mother, Harriet, has been hiding from her owner in the attic of the house that
Joseph lives in. But when Harriet’s hiding place is in danger of being revealed, she is forced to flee north to
safety only moments after being reunited with her family.

Devastated by losing his mother for the second time, Joseph begins to ponder the nature of the world he lives
in. Soon Joseph, seeking freedom and a place where he can be himself, follows his mother north. As he
searches for answers, Joseph experiences life in Massachusetts, California, Australia, and aboard a whaling
ship—but there’s no place where Joseph feels that he can truly be free.

In this companion novel to Letters from a Slave Girl, Joseph’s stirring quest for freedom and identity is told
through letters imagined by the author. Based on the real-life stories of Harriet and Joseph Jacobs, Letters
from a Slave Boy is set against the backdrop of some of the most exciting and turbulent times in American
history.
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From reader reviews:

Marc Gaul:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Letters from a Slave Boy: The
Story of Joseph Jacobs. All type of book can you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet
resources or other social media.

Sally Norman:

This Letters from a Slave Boy: The Story of Joseph Jacobs book is just not ordinary book, you have after that
it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is actually information inside this
book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you
will get. This kind of Letters from a Slave Boy: The Story of Joseph Jacobs without we realize teach the one
who examining it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't become worry Letters from a Slave Boy:
The Story of Joseph Jacobs can bring whenever you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn
out to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Letters from a Slave Boy: The
Story of Joseph Jacobs having very good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not
experience uninterested in reading.

Justin Pritchett:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to study a book. When you learn a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you want to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Letters from a Slave Boy: The Story of Joseph Jacobs provide you with new
experience in reading a book.

Alva Stephenson:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Letters from a Slave Boy: The Story of
Joseph Jacobs can be the respond to, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are consequently out of
date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
books have than the others?
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