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The American West of the nineteenth century was a world of freedom and adventure for men of every
stripe—not least also those who admired and desired other men. Among these sojourners was William
Drummond Stewart, a flamboyant Scottish nobleman who found in American culture of the 1830s and 1840s
a cultural milieu of openness in which men could pursue same-sex relationships.
 
This book traces Stewart’s travels from his arrival in America in 1832 to his return to Murthly Castle in
Perthshire, Scotland, with his French Canadian–Cree Indian companion, Antoine Clement, one of the most
skilled hunters in the Rockies. Benemann chronicles Stewart’s friendships with such notables as Kit Carson,
William Sublette, Marcus Whitman, and Jim Bridger. He describes the wild Renaissance-costume party held
by Stewart and Clement upon their return to America—a journey that ended in scandal. Through Stewart’s
letters and novels, Benemann shows that Stewart was one of many men drawn to the sexual freedom offered
by the West. His book provides a tantalizing new perspective on the Rocky Mountain fur trade and the role
of homosexuality in shaping the American West.
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From reader reviews:

Lee Nelson:

Now a day folks who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Examining a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information especially this Men in Eden: William Drummond Stewart
and Same-Sex Desire in the Rocky Mountain Fur Trade book as this book offers you rich facts and
knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you
probably know this.

Alan Trevino:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen in you if you take Men in Eden: William Drummond Stewart and Same-Sex
Desire in the Rocky Mountain Fur Trade as the daily resource information.

Thomas Baxter:

Typically the book Men in Eden: William Drummond Stewart and Same-Sex Desire in the Rocky Mountain
Fur Trade has a lot details on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was
written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research just before write this book. That book very
easy to read you may get the point easily after perusing this book.

Kevin Vickers:

Many people spending their time by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, do you
consider reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you can have
the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Men in Eden: William Drummond
Stewart and Same-Sex Desire in the Rocky Mountain Fur Trade which is having the e-book version. So , try
out this book? Let's observe.
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