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An indispensable text book for students in commerce and management streams

This book discusses various aspects of cost accounting – cost ascertainment, cost analysis and control, and
managerial decision making – in a logical and comprehensive manner. With extensive theoretical inputs,
large number of numerical illustrations, and rich pedagogy and exercises, it provides complete and up-to-
date coverage on the subject. It will meet the requirements of the students of B Com, M Com, CA, ICWA,
MBA and so on, for the course on cost accounting.

New in this edition:

• Thoroughly revised chapters – Cost: Concepts and Classification, Materials Control, Materials Costing,
Activity-based Costing, Process Costing, Marginal (Variable) Costing, Alternative Choices Decisions,
Standard Costing, Budgeting
• Additional topical coverage – Cost vs. Management Accounting, Capacity Costing
• Additional solved and unsolved problems throughout the text
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From reader reviews:

Kathleen Owens:

Do you one among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This Cost Accounting, 5e book is readable simply by you who hate the
perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving
also decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer involving Cost Accounting, 5e content
conveys the thought easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
content but it just different in the form of it. So , do you continue to thinking Cost Accounting, 5e is not
loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Faye Berg:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach,
or picnic in the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book may be option to fill your cost-free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the guide untitled Cost Accounting, 5e can be good book to read. May be it
might be best activity to you.

Mark Johnson:

Precisely why? Because this Cost Accounting, 5e is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting
for you to snap this but latter it will jolt you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book next to it was
fantastic author who else write the book in such amazing way makes the content interior easier to
understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this anymore or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book
have such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking method. So , still want to hold up
having that book? If I have been you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Paul Queen:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but also novel and Cost Accounting, 5e as well as others
sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel want to read
more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those publications
are helping them to increase their knowledge. In some other case, beside science publication, any other book
likes Cost Accounting, 5e to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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