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When a Diamond is a Girl's Worst Enemy

_________________________________

"Ever Locked is a powerful, heartbreaking and emotional love story about two souls destined to be together.
It’s also a story about risking everything in the name of love."
~ Ruty of Reading...Dreaming

_____________________________

Iris is engaged to Trip Dunnavin—the most eligible billionaire in Dallas. The five carats on her finger have
her future padlocked. But will Trip’s escalating temper and verbal abuse continue? Are her suspicions of his
infidelity the work of an overactive imagination?

Through a twist of fate that looks suspiciously like destiny, Iris meets Alonzo Locke—the handsome
gardener who’s nothing like her arrogant fiancé.

But when innocent flirtation becomes something real, the mysteries of Alonzo's own shadowy past are
discovered. Now Iris must make the hardest choice of her life.

It will take all the strength she has to do what must be done. Yet Iris is willing to sacrifice everything for the
one she loves ~ even love itself.

Secrets, lies and deceptions turn their world upside down. Can Alonzo right the wrongs done to them both
before it’s too late?
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Spradlin:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you
don't have spare time to do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer that question
mainly because just their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on guardería until university need this particular Ever Locked (Dunnavin
Saga Book 1) to read.

Nancy Reese:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a publication your ability to survive raise then having chance to remain than other
is high. For you who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Ever Locked (Dunnavin Saga
Book 1) book as beginner and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Roman Leonard:

Now a day people who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a book can help
folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Ever Locked (Dunnavin Saga Book 1) book as this
book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred per-cent guarantees
there is no doubt in it as you know.

Dennis Utley:

Within this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you need to do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books.
Among the books in the top collection in your reading list is definitely Ever Locked (Dunnavin Saga Book
1). This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious
person. By looking right up and review this book you can get many advantages.
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