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Descripción del Libro

Fresa Coco Almendra

8 – 10 fresas chicas congeladas

3 fresas frescas

1 taza de leche de coco

1 cucharada de mantequilla de almendra

1 cucharadita de miel

Chocolate Aguacate

1 aguacate

2 plátanos congelados

½ taza de frambuesas frescas o congeladas

1 – 2 cucharadas de cocoa sin endulzar en polvo

2 tazas de leche de almendras o de coco

Canela Coco Plátano

½ taza de leche de coco



4 yemas de huevo grandes

1 plátano mediano

¼ de taza de hielo

½ cucharadita de canela

¡Obtén el libro ahora para más recetas de Licuados Paleo! 
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From reader reviews:

Ronald Walker:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make you feel bored faster.
And you have time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They have to answer that
question because just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes,
it is appropriate. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this 10 Días de Purificación
con Licuado Verde (Spanish Edition) to read.

Thomas Rinaldi:

This 10 Días de Purificación con Licuado Verde (Spanish Edition) book is just not ordinary book, you have
it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information
inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information
you will get. That 10 Días de Purificación con Licuado Verde (Spanish Edition) without we understand teach
the one who reading through it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry 10
Días de Purificación con Licuado Verde (Spanish Edition) can bring when you are and not make your
handbag space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even cell phone.
This 10 Días de Purificación con Licuado Verde (Spanish Edition) having excellent arrangement in word as
well as layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Ronald Peyton:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve
that need more time to be study. 10 Días de Purificación con Licuado Verde (Spanish Edition) can be your
answer since it can be read by you actually who have those short extra time problems.

James Martin:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know everything
we would like. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This book 10 Días de Purificación con Licuado Verde (Spanish Edition) was filled in relation
to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has
diverse feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a
book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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